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##%* FILED: BROWARD COUNTY, FL HOWARD FORMAN,

Electronically Filed 04/22/2013 03:59:02 PM ET

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE SEVENTEENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT
IN AND FOR BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA

RODIER & RODIER, P.A., CASENO: CACE 13-07337 (21)

Plaintiff, Fla. Bar No.: 657476
vs.

DAVID CASSIDY,

Defendant.
/

AMENDED COMPLAINT

Plaintiff, RODIER & RODIER, P.A., by and through the undersigned counsel, hereby
sues Defendant, DAVID CASSIDY, and states as follows:

1. This is an action for damages in excess of Fifteen Thousand Dollars

($15,000.00), exclusive of costs, interest and attorney's fees.

2. At all times material hereto, the Plaintiff, RODIER & RODIER, P.A., was and

is a corporation conducting business in Broward County, Florida.

3, At all times material hereto, Defendant, DAVID CASSIDY, was and is a

resident of Broward County, Florida.

4, At all times material hereto, Plaintiff was and is a law firm with its principle

place of business at 400 N. Federal Highway, Hallandale, Florida 33009.

5. Defendant requested Plaintiff to perform services on behalf of Defendant, to
wit, representing and defending Defendant against claims of material misrepresentation,
breach of oral contract, breach of fiduciary duty and unfair and deceptive trade practices in
the case of Edward Lipton v. David Cassidy, Broward County Case #2007-03197 CACE
(03).




COUNT I - BREACH OF AGREEMENT TO PAY FOR LEGAL SERVICES

6. Plaintiff and Defendant entered into an agreement for legal representation
where Plaintiff agreed to perform legal services on behalf of Defendant and Defendant
agreed to pay Plaintiff for said legal services and costs. Specifically, on or about November
28, 2006, Defendant contacted Plaintiff by telephone advising he was being threatened with a
cause of action for damages arising out of the purchases and sales of thoroughbred race
horses. Defendant requested Plaintiff to represent him and defend him in such action and
Plaintiff agreed to represent and defend Defendant at the rate of $400 per hour plus costs,
which Defendant accepted. Accordingly, Plaintiff began legal representation and work at

Defendant's direction.

7. Following the commencement of work, Plaintiff sent Defendant detailed
billing invoices for the work performed. Defendant began making payments for legal
services he hired Plaintiff to perform. The last payment for legal services was made by

Defendant on March 26, 2010. .

8. In all, Plaintiff performed legal services on behalf of Defendant from
November 2006 through March 2011 and provided Defendant detailed billing invoices
totaling $134,221.50 for all legal services rendered and costs expended. A copy of Plaintiff's
billing invoice is attached hereto as Exhibit “A”. At all times up until April 18, 2012,
defendant promised to pay but never did, and finally on April 18, 2012, defendant
affirmatively represented that no payment would ever be made, thereby breaching the

agreement.

£ Defendant breached his obligations to the Plaintiff by refusing or otherwise
failing to pay Plaintiff in full for the legal services rendered. Specifically, Defendant has
made only limited payments to Plaintiff in the amount of $25,000.00. There is still a balance
of $109,221.50 due and owing, which Defendant promised to pay but has since refused to

pay.



10. Accordingly, Plaintiff has been damaged and is entitled to recover the full
value of the services that were provided to Defendant plus all applicable interest and costs.

Prejudgment interest to date totals $5,428.94 and continues to accrue.

- COUNT II - QUANTUM MERUIT

11. In the alternative, Plaintiff is entitled to recover his legal fees from Defendant

under the doctrine of Quantum Meruit.

12. The Defendant requested that Plaintiff perform legal services for the benefit of
the Defendant. Specifically, on or about November 28, 2006, Defendant contacted Plaintiff
by telephone advising he was being threatened with a cause of action for damages arising out
of the purchases and sales of thoroughbred race horses. Defendant requested Plaintiff to
represent him and defend him in such action and Plaintiff agreed to represent and defend
Defendant at the rate of $400 per hour, which Defendant accepted. Accordingly, Plaintiff

began legal representation and work at Defendant's direction.

13. Plaintiff performed the legal services as requested to the satisfaction of the
Defendant from November 2006 through March 2011 and provided Defendant detailed
billing invoices totaling $134,221.50 for all legal services rendered and costs expended.

Plaintiff's billing invoice is attached hereto as Exhibit “A”.
14. Defendant was aware that Plaintiff expected to be compensated.

15. The Defendant made only limited payments to Plaintiff totaling $25,000.00
and has not paid the Plaintiff in full for the legal services rendered. Defendant has been
unjustly enriched by reaping the benefits of the legal services he ordered and directed
plaintiff to perform, but as of April 18, 2012, has affirmatively refused to pay for those

services.

16. Accordingly, Plaintiff is entitled to the reasonable value of the legal services

that were provided to Defendant plus all applicable interest and costs.



WHEREFORE, Plaintiff, RODIER & RODIER, P.A., demands judgment for
damages against the Defendant, DAVID CASSIDY, interest, costs and whatever additional

relief this honorable court deems equitable and just.

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I HEREBY CERTIFY that a true and correct copy of the within document was sent via e-
mail to Andrew D. Wyman, Esq., 312 S.E. 17" Street, Second Floor, Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33316
@ awyman@lawspgh.com and jeolabelli@lawspgh.com on this i-& day of APRAL. 2013,

RODIER & RODIER, P.A.
Attorneys at Law

400 North Federal Highway
Hallandale, FL. 33009

Tel: (954) 455-9300

Fax: (954) 457-0499
serviceofpleadings@rodierlegal.com

st
it
e

Al

BRIAN M/ RODIER, E
Fla. Bar No. 42250

R. BRIAN'BQYD, ESQ.
Fla. Bar #: 0657476




" RODIER RODIER, PA . DETALOFTIMEANDCOSTS David Cassidy adv. Ed Lipton

DATE DESCRIPTION My X Yy, | | HOURS

-11/28/2006 Phone Conference with David re _3_5_ EQm and scope of ﬁmwﬂmmm:ﬁmzo: ,. S . . 04
- 11/30/20086 Phone Conference with David re maa_zosm_ ﬁmoﬂm and cam:Q\ oﬁ oo:ﬁmnﬁ_:m Lavin - B 0.2
©11/30/2006 Letter of Representation to Lavin _ R ¥ S S , 0.2
12/1/2006 Extended detailed Teleconference with DO B .. R ’ o 0.65
12/1/2008 review of email pdf and jpeg attachments umgmwj_:@ to a_mucﬁm S ; : , : 0.25
12/3/2006 Extended TC with Gary re Ed Lipton, character, prior amﬁmamam m,a : : 0.5
12/3/2006 Review and memorialization of facts revealed by Gary- .~~~ .. 7 | / - 0.2
12/3/2006 Extended email to DC outlining all issues, theories and _m@m_ n_m: ST 0.5
12/4/2008 Rec of fax from DC, all prior. emai Umgmm: DCand EL - = Ny y 0.6
12/4/2006 Extended Telephone conference é;: DC e R 3 , - 035
12/4/2006 Rec of email form DC . K7 SR . 0.1
12/4/2008 Extended TC with Lavin re case m::ma at. ﬂmmo_cmg and noﬂc::m our vOmEom . ; 0.75
12/4/2006 Email to.client _ 0.1
12/6/2006 Extended & detailed letter to _.m<5 re our nom&o: and m:m;\m,m 8325@ claim o ; 0.4
12/6/2006 TC with DC're proposed letier to Lavin, style and mccmﬁm:om 2, _ 0.2
12/15/2006 TC with DC re Ed trying to @mH g.mma_:@ ".moo_dm , S . . - 0.2
0 12/20/2006 TCwithDC %, Yy & T G v v 0.15
- - 12/20/2008 2nd TC with DC LAY _ YN _ A - 0
: 12/20/2006 3rd TC with DC y o ‘ .. R - , 0.1
12/21/2006 Letter from Lavin re records and xm: Imm<m: purse ) : . 0.2
12/21/2008 TC with Lavin re Half Heaven and records; global resolution «o_. _ucﬂmm ‘proceeds . / 0.5
12/21/2006 TC with-DC while in Ocala, TC with friend Ed re Lipton, fax of letters to DC ¥ 0.35
- 12/21/2006 Pull statute cited by Lavin, TC w/l.avin to advise only mun__mm 1o _,m@_mﬁmaa entities o Yy 0.4
12/22/2006 Letter from Lavin, extended, re recerds and Lipton's refusal to sign release : ‘ 0.3
- 12/22/2006 TC wilavin re mediation for global seitlement, ammmm_d: <m:%< Qﬂ uc_,mm claim ¢ 0.4
- 12/29/2006 TC w/DC re case Status, could not talk; off to Detroit ~ = .~ ° . E . G
2/9/2007 Rec of email from Andy Lavin, with lawsuit attached i) ,.,H.. N 0.2
2/9/2007 Detailed review of 12 page complaint and letter 2N : s : ) : 0.8
2/9/2007 TC with Lavin re complaint, cannot agree to accept setvice wiour o__ma consent 0.2
2/9/2007 TC with David to advise of complaint and Lipton's intentions, Q_mocmmma Bm_,; : . 0.25
2/23/2007 Email to DC re complaint filed and Judge™ 0.2
2/23/2007 Further review of complaint for creation of file memo ocmﬁ_:@ m:m@m:osm AT : 1.25
2/27/2007 Email from Lavin, email forwarded toDC . %, . . : 0.2
3/15/07 TC with Andrew Lavin re extension to Emoosa to com u_m_:ﬁ R v . 0.25

3/15/07 Draft LT DAT requesting extension” .~ - . D, O 0.2



. RODIER RODIER, P.A. ' DETAILOF TIME AND COSTS _ David Cassidy adv. Ed Lipton

3/15/07 DFT proposed order o S m Y% _ _ 02

3/16/07 RR 3/16/07 LF Lavin w proposed. m@wmma oamﬂ & émcm_ﬁm vm@mm . : . ; 0.3
3/16/07 TCT lavin- left message . PR s - : . 0.1
3/16/07 TCF Lavin - re his agreed order is %Sm e/ SR - : : 0.2
-3/20/2007 TC with BB and Lavin, follow up email No DC ey Y ; 0.25
3/22/07 RR 3/19/07 Letter from opposing.counsel: to anm W ngomma oamﬂ . . , 0.2
3/28/07 RR executed order from judge - - / A K44 0.1
4/6/07 Research misrepresentation cause of action 7/ . . S - 0.6
4/6/07 Research breach of oral contract cause of action. AR I . / 0.55
4/6/07 Research breach of fiduciary duty cause of action ~ |~~~ . 0.7
4/6/07 Research deceptive and unfair trade Qmogomm cause of momo: Y : _ 1.15
DFT & w<m Motion to dismiss for %m%:m 8 state a cause Q moco: 2 3 the mxmq:mim motion %2 more gﬁsmm _
4/6/07 statement otk DM v A . . 1456
4/6/07 DFT motion to stay discovery .‘ ‘ N - NS v.., : , . : : 0.3
4/25/07 Prepare argument outline for :mm:sm on _soaos to mﬁmw X% 4 . . 0.5
4/25/07 RS case law, Florida Rules of Oocm L . n V. 2, 1.5
4/25/07 DFT e-mail to BMR o ST LU 7 > IR : 0.3
4/26/07 TF office to Court House (rush 30:3 g /M A - . 0.7
4/26/07 AT hearing on Motionto Stay .. "~ . . o Xy . b 0.65
4/26/07 Travel from courthouse to office -, - Y B ,. AR : : - 045
4/26/07 Calendar discovery response due amﬁm i - S O % o 01
TC with DC re case, meeting set via "m_mv:o:m for m@.ou Q_mocmmma a.moo<m€ and wmmxm to be ooB_Q_mﬂma ptior to E .
512/2007 832%8 v . - A ‘ 0.25
5/2/2007 email from Lavin h o My, Y Vo : 0.1
5/9/2007 review of discovery documents in anmﬁmmo: for oosﬁm_,m:om sﬁ: DC. , ¥ . 0.75
TC w/DC re completing discovery. am_oo:mmw and ommm mﬂmwmm% a,mncmmuo: filing Qn PFS re Om:ma_m: <s: proceeds,
5/9/2007 slander - o 0.8
5/9/2007 TC with Louse re production aoocamam m:n _:ﬁoﬂamﬂ_o: angaa 0.2
5/9/2007 Follow up TC with David re my TC with Louise, documents in his mxn_cmzo possession, filing of 57.105 motion o 0.25
TC with Lavin re case, deadlines 8« a_mooéé m:a mx"m:m_o: ﬁmmcmmﬂ timetable if mxa:m_o: cannot be met, requested :
5/9/2007 letter . 0.25
Preparation of ﬂo_.Smm ﬁmm_oonmmm 8 Sﬂm:.ommﬁo:mm Em with ooﬁi wm?wo_ :voz Lavin. Letter to Lavin re production
. 5/14/2007 E,omﬁmmm . o - 0.65
- 5/14/2007 TC with Louise re items for an:o:o: a_mo:mmmg extent of Esmﬁ msm sma and she was directed to UPS package . 0.2

5/16/2007 Rec and rev email letter from _.m<_: oﬂomm ﬂmﬁ to _,mmwo:mmm m:a msm,_ cmox «mu;\ A : 0.25



" RODIER RODIER, P.A, ' DETAL OF TIME AND COSTS A David Cassidy adv. Ed Lipton

- 5/16/2007 Email to David re Lavin correspondence A 5. Xp, g, / 0.05

5/24/07 RR 5/16/07 Letter from Lavin re: Motion ﬁo Ooaum_ L] . . ; 0.1
5/24/07 Multiple strategy emails with BMR -~ .- T o . 0.25 -
5/30/07 RR 5/23/07 Letter from Lavin - -+~ LRI X - N _ : . 0.1
5/30/07 RR Motion to Compel and Proposed- Order o: the same . i o 4 : 0.15
- B/31/2007 rec of emall ans attachment re §m< ,6 m:_o_m *mmnc:m mBm_n vmow »o UO re clarification 7 ‘ 0.75
6/5/07 RR Re-notice of hearing : oo _ / 0.1
©/5/07 RR order on Motion to Compel _,wwvo:mm _6 mmncwmﬁ for muqoaco:o: , . - j . 0.1
S .. . 8/12/07 Receive and Analyze Notice of Production from Non-Party chmmm_[_.v ) : 0.25
. 8/12/07 Draft objection to Notice of Production j,oB Non- wumE\ Amcmmm_._.v in o . 0.2
.- B/13/07 Revise response to request for Qoacoﬂ_os ] Wy o . \ 1.15
6/13/07 RR Motion for Sanction & hearing” = - . N A 0.25
8/15/07 TCT Lavin re we already responded to z._m:, ngcbmﬁ for. _uw,oacowoﬁ m:a mszE to work ouf Zozg »o Compel - .. 0.3
6/15/07 Draft E-Mail re better answers Y _ PR/ 0.2
6/18/07 RR letter from Lavin re 6/21/07. 3mm::@ v e O, 0.1
8/19/07 Prepare for hearing-on Motion to Oo:.__om_ vmg@. m:méma </ N A . 0.3
6/19/07 TF office to Court House {rush hour) - o TR 0.7
8/19/07 Attend hearing on Motion to Ooavm_ L : % de, ‘ . 0.7
6/19/07 TF Court house to Office V.. C L T Gy _ oy 0.4
6/18/07 DEC to BMR detailing judge's order- m:n_ need for further _:ﬁoﬁam:o: o /S 0.3
6/20/07 RR _m:m_, from Lavin re Motion to.Compel hearing : - 2, , 0.1
© 8/20/07 TCT Lavin re responses and what he will _xm_V\ raise as oEmo:o:m S o . ' 0.25
6/21/07 Draft Memo to File re the likely objections: - L ‘ 0.25
6/23/07 RR LF Lavin re proposed agreed oamﬂ on Motion to _u_wa_mm s . v 0.1
6/23/07 RR LT Judge with proposed agreed order. - e VP g v - 02
6/23/07 RR Email from favin re proposed agreed. order + letter - - 2 s v _ 0.1
6/25/07 RR agreed order on motion fo dismiss; cal response dates - ARV o : . 0.2
6/26/07 RR Motion to Compel Betier Wmmvo:mm 6 Request for ancoﬂ_o: o : ) " 0.35
6/26/07 Draft Memo to File R O, 0.2
6/29/07 RR Notice of Hearing on hearing of 7/10/07. - S , 'y © 0.1
6/29/07 RR Motion to Compel (Request for Production) with mzmo::,_mam 7 0.25
7/5/07 RR Letter from opposing counsel re responses to Request wo,, Poaco:o: and _:ﬁmzonmﬁo:mm‘ i 0.2
7/5/07 RR Motion to Compel Better Answers {o interrogatories .~ - - ; . 0.2
7/5/07 RR Notice of Hearing re Better Answers to Interrogatories R /R . 0.1
7/5/07 Draft Memo to File re need better Answers 8 _Rmzo@mﬁo:mw u@ oo:_.n oaw_. _ 0.2

7/8/07 RR _.mnmﬁ from Lavin re hearing 9n .\:o\cw NN/ . - 0.2



RODIER RODIER, _u> | o A DETAIL OF jzm >zo costs 2 David Cassidy adv. Ed Lipton

7/10/07 Prepare for hearing on Def's Motion 6 Ooanm_ Umnmq EmnOw:m 8 mmncmﬂ for _u_,oacoﬂ_o:‘ . . . : 0.4
7/10/07 TF office to Court House {rush 395 ; : : . 0.7
7/10/07 Attend hearing AP AT : 0.9
7/10/07 TF Court House to office Y N A T s YA A, 0.6
7/10/07 Note file re results of hearing & calendar ﬁo do : UL ) /. . , 4 0.2
7/11/07 RR Letter from Lavin with aftached order - - Vs : 0.1
7/13/07 RR letter from Lavin re Motion 1o Uasmmm : A A o _ 0.2
7/13/07 Analyze ooanmmi to Prepare for nro:m om: éms opposing ooc:mm_ N . : , - 0.25
7/13/07 TC with opposing counsel S MYy : : 0.25
7/13/07 TC with opposing counsel re agreed oam_, in lieu of gm:sm - o . / 0.2
7/16/07 RR 7/11/07 Letter from Lavin =~ .~ 7P __,_ V.. - . : 0.1
7/16/07 DFT Proposed Agreed Order.on zo:o: to D_mB_mm L e 7/ o , - 0.2
7/16/07 DFT Letter to Lavin - Y N, M 4, 0.2
7/16/07 TCT Pam @ Lavin's office < T L : , 0.2
7/16/07 Draft E- Mail to opposing counsel 5_5 mxmo:%mam 'y A : o 0.1
7/16/2007 Review of interrogatories supplemental Qmﬂ_o_mso_mm fo Um m&ﬁmmmma . : 0.5
7/17/07 TCE Lavin in Colorado re Motion to Dismiss -~ .~ " 7" Ay , 0.3
7/17/12007 email from DC re Contessa and Seltzer. -~ = T, LN A . . : . 0.05.
7/18/07 TCT Lavin re Motion to dismiss . = = - ., 2, T P 7o . / o : 0.2
7/18/07 Draft and Revise agreed order .~ .~~~ . - A 0.2
7/20/07 Revise Lstier to lavin re revised >@ﬂmma Oam« RN - S _ E .02
7/20/07 FN revised Agreed order : R A Ay . : 0.1
7/20/07 TC with opposing counsel . ‘ Lo . : Y , 0.2
7/20/07 TCF lavin - he will be sending me a 85m8 mmamg order .. : _ 0.2
7/20/07 RR Letter from Lavin and proposed agreed order .~ = . 0 . 0.2
7/20/07 TCT opposing counsel o request mxﬁm:m_o: to _.mmuosm 8 _sﬁmzo@mmo:mm & m@«mma oamq is ok~ ‘A . 0.2°
7/20/07 RR letter from Lavin to Judge 0.1
w\mc\*woow TC with David re case, rogs and status. cuamﬁm 05

7/20/2007 review of lavin letter re agreed order and his. new <ma_os gn oam« @_53@ us more amﬁ_:;m mﬁmﬂwama of his claims /) 0.2

7/23/07 Receive m Mail from lavin re going to hearing tomorrow - 0.1
7/23/07 TCT Lavin to work out issues in lieu of hearing /N : : 03
7/23/07 Recejve proposed agreed order for smm:nm of 7/24/07 . . . 02
7/23/07 TCT lavin re changes PRI N . / , 0.2
7/23/07 RR revised proposed order and _mxm_‘ to Ea@m R _ / 0.2
7/23/07 TC with David Cassidy, conference in ma Seitzer draft 3o~mm Ho ﬁmmoo:a to _:ﬁm:.onm”o:mm ) 0.8

7/23/07 DFT Memo to File re seltzer /A L LN o.@m



~ RODIER RODIER, P.A. T H DETAIL o_u q_zm»zo CosTS AL ~ David Cassidy adv. Ed Lipton

,Emw\oﬂ Begin %mm of >3m:ama Answer to _Rm:,ommﬂo:mw . H . / . 0.35

7/24/07 Continued draft of Amended Answers to Interrogatories’ ), SV , o ; 0.35
7124/07 Initial TCT Louise Russeli re _:qoacoﬁ_oz and :mommw_q of ao cBmZm 7, , Y . - 03
7/24/07 Draft E-Mail to Louise S T i . : 01
7/24/07 Prepare documents for Louise - o, N/ R 2 R A & 0.2
7124107 Fax from Cassidy re Lipton's no:ﬁowo:w . ¥ RN - . fé v 0.2
7{25/07 Complete.draft of 58:829._8 awno:mmm 7 A - . . 035
7/25/07 Receive E-Mali from Louise x2 - s o : . _ 0.2
7/25/07 Draft E-Mail to Louise x2 = S PREE ¢ S 7 N v . / 0.2
7/25/07 Fax to Louise - e Y S . . . 0.1.
7/25/07 TGF Louise re all horses oﬂ just ﬁ:m ones oégma by Sm _omz_mm Ny , 0.3
7/25/07 TCT BMR - discuss court's ruling - o S R - / . 0.2
7/26/07 FN amended Interrogatories -~ G My Y . . 0.2
7/26/07 TCT Louise re production of ma%_o:m_ n_oocamaw WS TN Pn _ / 0.2
7/26/07 TCF-BMR re Amended Answers to. _Rmzc@mmo:mm W A , : 0.2
7/26/07 TCT Ed Seltzer re deposition dates - 0.2

7/26/07 Draft E-Mail to BMR re depo of seftzer .+ ATy s 0.2

7/26/07 DFT Notice of Taking Deposition Ed mmzmmw 0.2
7/31/07 TCT Cassidy re iurat page and review of 0.25
7/131/07 FN Amended Answers fo _Rmzomm»o:mm 0.2
7/31/07 Receive E-Mail from Louise- mcmmm: 0.1
7/31/07 TCT roEmm Russell . 0.2
8/1/07 Receive.E-Mail from Louise that aoocamam are being.sent’ . A o . 0.2
8/3/07 Initial review of documents sent from Louise for production re :oﬂmmm in-common S : 1.85
8/6/07 Initial review of documents sent from roEmm for E.oacoﬁ_os ﬁm :oamm ZO,_, in common - 2.3
8/6/07 TCT Lavin . B 0.2
8/8/07 DFT Letter to Lavin re Qoacﬁ_o: 0.2
8/6/07 DFT Amended Response to xmncmmﬁ *9, _u_.oacow_o: 0.25
8/6/07 TCT Copy service 0.2
&/7/07 RR mxmocﬂma Agreed Order on baa _ Qoacoﬂ_o: m:n B@m SR . . 01
8/7/07 RR 5<o_om for copies of add'l production, DFT Letter to _m<5 ﬂmx . o A i : 0.25
8/7/07 TCT Lavin's office - Pam re um«Bma Qﬂ 5<o_om vmoq fo UBE:@ Eu QoSBm:H : _ 0.2
8/10/07 Pick up copies from Sav Quick - . v . . o s 0.3
8/10/07 RR check and letter from Lavin ~ -~ = - B v e ; 0.1
8/13/07 TCT Lavin re pick up documents .~ .~ -+ .~ v , 7 0.2
8/18/07 T/C from _.mc_: s office that %m% are mmza_:@ ﬁjm: courier *9, Qoo A ‘ 0.1




RODIER RODIER, P.A. L oﬂzro_maém.yzo_ooﬂm %,  David Cassidy adv. Ed Lipton

8/20/07 opposing. oocsmm_ Bncmms:m mm:mmﬁ 8 cm wmmajmnc_ma 0.1
8/20/07 TCT Lavin g, LT L - 025
8/20/07 TCT Seltzer : N, My _ o 7 _ 0.1
8/20/07 DFT Subpoena Duces Tecum mmxwwﬁ W Y s T . 0.2
8/20/07 DFT Amended Notice of Taking Umvom;_o: mm_ﬁwmﬁ e S , . ” 0.1
8/20/07 Draft E-Mail to BMR TR AR o _ , 0.1
8/20/07 DFT Notice of Taking Deposition gﬂ _.68: o, A A , 0.2
8/22/07 RS affirmative defenses for answer to manama ooEvmm_a IR, : . h 1.85
8/22/07 DFT and FN answer to amended complaint - - N M v 0.8
8/22/07 Draft E-Mail to BMR re amended.complaint - - Ton . s, v , 0.1
8/22/07 Receive E-Mail from BMR re mﬁmzm_os % o0, My S R . : 041
8/22/07 TC with opposing counsel /% .. - B R / 7, - 02
8/22/07 Draft E-Mail to BMR ) LY T i i e . 0.1
8/23/07 cover letterfor 2 Notice of qu_:@ Umuomao: to _.m<_: | 5 _,U_... Ly 0.2
8/30/07 RR Letter of August 28, 07 from Lavin . , 4 0.1
8/31/2007 Extended TC with DC re finalizing. ﬂmmvosmm to mams%a mnmé@. m:q mm_wamﬁzm defenses . 075
8/31/2007 Formal editing. m:a final prep ; msa mom: 94 answer 8 mgmjamg ooEu_m_:ﬁ . . 0.35
©9/3/2007 emall to David re Answer o i o i/ , : _ 0.1
9/10/07 RS Plea for Altorney's Fees under Em wnm” 501 N‘Bm S % T . Y : 0.95

" 9/17/07 Multiple TCs with opposing ooc:mm_ 3 gmvo%_oz Qﬂ _._Eo: SRV, T Y, 7 © 0.85
9/19/07 DFT Proposal for Setilement s ORE  O. v 11
9/10/07 DFT Plea for Attorney's Fees -~ . .. . .o 00 o . 0.3

9/19/07 RR 9/19/07 Letter from Lavin .- L) BN PR A - , _ 0.2
9/19/07 RR 57.105 Motion {proposed) ° . , M ‘ . . 0.25
. 9/23/2007 Letter from Lavin o _ /NN Y. Y (:: 0.2
-9/23/2007 TC with Lavin re Contessa; m:,m:@mama %2 him 8 come 8 _u_o_,a.m - o . 0.25
Qmw\moo.\. Review of file to-begin track of to do items; mﬂam:om smmama to o.oBc_mﬁ MSJ on Statute of _uﬁmca % -1.25
9/24/07 RR 9/19/07 Letter from opposing counsel- -/, 0.1
9/24/07 RR mailed OJ (we already received. ﬂxm *mxwg version);. <m,.=a _.6 o:m:@mm B - 0.5
8/24/07 RR 9/20/07 Letter from opposing ¢ 8c:mm_ . : : _ 01

Multiple TC with Seltzer re: mcgom:mm <m:€ service on wm_ﬁmﬂ _mxm_, 8 _.m<_: letter fo mmgcqm 2 Amended NTD-DT;
924107 2 wcgom:mm 0.85°

8/24/07 TCT opposing.counsse! re moving anom a:m 8 Ic_,:om:mm m, _sos:m mm_,ﬁNmﬂ amvow_cos T ‘ 0.2
10/2/07 DFT Letter to court with amended Notice of Taking Umwom;_o: : N ) 0.2
10/2/07 Draft Duces Tecum for Notice of .&.mx_sm Deposition Lipton™.: . 1.35
10/3/07 RR _mxm« wog OC re objection 8 Q.oaco:o: m:a zo:o: dﬂo_. ﬂ«oﬁmaﬂzm O_dQ.




" RODIER RODIER, P.A, - DETALOFTIMEANDCOSTS = . David Cassidy adv. Ed Lipton

10/3/07 RR _so:o: for Protective O&mw : Gy Yy, 4 . . 0.2

10/3/07 Lax o Mia travel -~ . D, 0, L% " v 6.5
10/4/07 BMR 1 hour conversation with wm:Nmﬂ ; , > / : ; 1
10/4/07 BMR 2 hour mesting with client - ¥ 2
Deposition Preparation: Review Qooc3m3m Uancoma in meo:mm 8 _,mncmmﬁ for _uwoaco:o: RS Count IV Trads
10/4/07 Practics, Draft Topic outline; aic : 525
10/5/07 TF office to deposition _ - 0.5
10/5/07 AT deposition of Lipton {10:45 8 moov . T v o v 7.3
10/5/07 TF depo o office ‘ Y T RN o % Sy . 0.5
10/5/07 DFT deposition summary X L LY, : . . 1.55
10/8/07 TCT court reporter Katherine re oﬁam::@ amuo qm:ma:E 303@ :Bm o S ! . : 0.1
10/8/07 DFT letter to lavin re copies of mxj__u_ﬁm VR LR el . 0.2
10/8/07 Deposition of Ed Seltzer 23 o Y / L : o 4 2
10/8/07 FLL to LAX travel LTI T PSR S . 6.5
10/10/07 RR 10/8/07 letter from lavin re mxy&;m A RN A : Yy o 0.1
10/10/07 RR 10/8/07 Letter from Lavin re depo, o* Ommm_% L A SR G.1
10/11/07 RR Letter from lavin re e-mails 7 M, : . . 0.1
10/16/07 RR filed 57.105 motion A P . ./ R . fn 0.2
10/22/07 RR 10/15/07 Letter from opposing. oocsmm_ re v..oacomo: SR . e 0.2
10/26/07 Z_c:_n_m TC with OC's office for extension to answer 2nd mmn\_u_,oa A - ) o : . 0.3
10/30/07. RR 10.25.07 Letter from Lavin re Ommm_%m ambow_zoz . S X - . / 0.2
10/30/07 RR Notice of Taking Depesition . =~ - * . /s : y 0.2
11/2/07 RR 10/31/07 Letter from lavin - .~ .~ i s A : 5 0.1.
11/2/07 DFT Letter to lavin re depo - haven't muowm: 8 client - wmm_, <oc« oE: oomﬁm , 0.2
11/2/07 RR 2nd Request for Production ,403 Lavin * , e A C 02
11/2/07 RRreply - : SR TS T WA 7/ S 0. : . 0.15
11/2/07 DFT 1st RQ For Production 7 TR A N < - 0.75
11/6/07 Draft cover lirfo opposing counsel =~~~ ‘p 5 Y _ _ 0.2
11/12/07 RR 11/5/07 letter from opposing counsel ,. 0 o 01
11/12/07 RR Notice of Hearing on Motion 8 Ooaum_ S &, - : 0.1
11/12/07 RR Motion to Compel : M Ny, = 0.1
11/12/07 DFT Response to Second mmncmmﬁ ﬁoﬁ U_,oacozo: A ( : v . - 0.55
11/12/07 DFT Letter to opposing counsel . . PR R _ . ‘ , 0.2
11/12/07 DFT Objection, DFT Motion for szwomzo: m:a mxﬁm:m_o: o% Sjm B /.3 . , 0.65
11/13/07 TCF Scott Tuck in Lavin's office. - D_mocmm mmjmma oamw, in. :mc Qn :mm::@ , . 0.3

11/13/07 mmoﬂowommam@«moaoamﬂ T, [ PR ( . - 0.15



RODIER RODIER, P.A. . DETAILOFTIME AND COSTS - David Cassidy adv. Ed Lipton

11/13/07 Draft E-Mall to Scott Tuck - agreed orderis ok - - - . _ 0.1

11/13/07 Recelve E-Mail from scott tuck re deposition date - 7 N S . : . 0.1
11/13/07 TCT Scott re we haven't been able to speak with our o__ma -no ano amﬁm _ : : : 0.2
11/13/07 RR Motion to Compel Deposition date (mailed) e : . ‘ 6.1
11/13/07 DFT Letter to Gassidy re 2nd request and depo date v % y : . . 0.2
11/16/07 Return telephone callto Lavin - T : : . : : 0.25
11/26/07 Anaalyze file re response to 2nd mmncma for P.o%oﬂ_o: PR A v Yy, 03
11/26/07 TCT Lavin re Response to2nd Request for Production & Umnomzos ama T : : 0.3
11/26/07 DFT Letter to Lavin re Response to 2nd Request for naacg_o: N Y /N _ . 0.2
11/26/07 EN Respanse to 2nd Request for _u_.oacomo: o S N e : 0.15
12/3/07 E-mail re depo date for Cassidy” , SR -0
12/3/07 TCT Lavin's office re depo of Cassidy & om:ommmw_o: of jmmz:@ , dr WA , 0.2
12/3/07 TCF Lavin's office re they want 8 go mozcma Emr ”rm :mm: @ c:_mmm we mEm them a December amﬂm . , 0.2
12/4/07 TF office to Court House R4 T A S, < J : : : 0.7
12/4/07 AT hearing on Motion to Compel Dmvo AN . . : : 0.2
12/4/07 TF Court House o office 7 7y Wy . o _ 0.45
12/10/07 TCF Lavin's office re extension to- »,mmvo:a 8 mmmcmmﬁ ﬂQ. _uagcoﬁ_o: A a3 . v 0.2
12/10/07 RR Lstter from cpposing counsel re confirming extension:. - 015
12/16/07 RR Notice of Hearing on Motion to Compel 1/7/07 ..~ . .+ . v y 0.1
12/10/07 Receive and Analyze Plaintiff Motion to Compel (for rmm:zm on. \:ﬂod . , 0.3
12/12/07 RR 12.10.07 Letter from opposing counsel re extension ~ .~ -~ 0.1
12/12/07 RR Notice of Taking Deposition. Ommm_%m nmuoﬂzos VS 4 ,... . ‘ , 0.2
12/12/07 TCT Lavin's office re location of deposifion. - - . Tl Y 0.2
12/20/07 DFT M/Compel Response to Request for Production ~ .~ .-~~~ - 04
12/21/07 TCF Lavin's office re extension fo _,mmuo:a Ho _u_moo<m2 R/ _ 0.2
12/21/07 DFT propesed agreed order On . W, 0
12/21/07 DFT Letter to Lavin re proposed agreed o_.am« IR . a ‘ : 0.2
12/21/07 DFT Letter to judge re agreed order - . o A t L ; A 0.2
12/24/07 Receive E-Mall from opposing ooc:mm_ with. mnmo:ma tetter m:a Eon0mmg agreed order 7, 0.25
12/24/07 TCT opposing counsel re our order was m_am% sent o the Ea@m X _ v - : 0.2
1/2/08 FU with opposing counsel re agreed, order: - : - , / : 0.2
1/2/08 RS FRCP and case law on separating. Qoacoﬁ_o: of QoSBmam 8 Eu for hearing on Plaintiff zouo: to Ooavm ‘ 0.45
1/2/08 DFT objection to PL's Motion to Compel & Prepare argument oE::m for hearing . . . 0.35
1/4/08 RRresponse to Defs 1st Request for Production - no documents mzmosma T , 0.2
1/4/08 DFT Motion for Sanctions & Motion to oojmscm amuom;_o: , ; 0.45

1/4/08 DFT Notice of hearing-addon - = . - . A " .” ; B v o _ 0.1



' RODIERRRODIER PA. ~© "~ DETAIL OF TIME AND COSTS VR David Cassidy adv. Ed Lipton

1/7/2008 RR Letter from opposing counsel 1.7. om: D ____._ g ; s 73 0.1

1/7/2008 Draft Notice of Cancellation of Hearing =~ N o AP 0.1
1/11/2008 RR Executed Order from Judge: Q_‘m:g@ Defendant _so\mo: 8 OoEum_ 0.1
1/11/2008 Draft Letter to opposing counsel Response | to Request for. Production™ . v : 0.1
1/11/2008 TCF opposing counsel re discovery amno:mmw will be rmﬂm :mxﬁ Emmx { A’ 0.2

_ . - 1/11/2008 Draft Memo to File & e-mail to BMR 2 ¥ L ; 041
o 111412008 Draft Motion to Strike Pleadings for mm_uc_.m o 0032< with _u_mooéé ) 0.75
1 1/14/2008 Rec and rev request for admissions, forward via email to DC with: ‘ ‘ 0.4
1/16/2008 RR 1.16.08 Letter from opposing counsel re aoocamsﬁm ﬂmmvo:m:\m 8 _Nmncmmﬁ for P.oacomo: . 0.1
1/16/2008 TC with _.ms: re QmUOm and ancoﬂ_o: : 0.5
116/2008 TC with UO re amuomao: mza v_.ogcoﬂ_os wmx_nm Oo:ﬁmmmm m:a hosmm mqm.ﬁm@w_ mmgcmmﬁ dﬁow magam“osm directions . 0.28
1/16/2008 TC with Lavin re depos again = 0.186
1/16/2008 Rec and rev letter from Lavin re our. _mxmﬁ ﬂmmmasn his E;Sm fo ooBu_u\ with promise to- tender documents 0.2
1/17/2008 RR 1.17.08 Letter from opposing ooc:mm_ re Cassidy Qmwomm_o ‘s . , , 0.1
1/17/2008 RR 1.17.08 Notice of Taking Deposition Cassidy ~ ~~~ . = -~ . . . 0.1
1/21/2008 TCF opposing counsel re documents. ﬁmmvo:mzm to WD . R/ o , : 0.2
1/21/2008 Draft Letter to opposing counsel "~ .. Y - i : 0.2
1/22/2008 TCF Lavin re $0.15 per page - . TR R A /T 0.25
1/22/2008 TCT Sav-Quick Printing T S Sl : X : 0.2
1/22/2008 TCT Lavin 0., Y S R >, ‘ .
1/22/2008 Draft E-Mail to BMR re copies and 39.5@ QmquEo: to Eo:gmv\ (R LAY . 0.1
1/22/2008 RR Letter from opposing counsel1:22.08:re documents amuo:m__,a to RQ _ 0.1
1/23/2008 RR 2nd Letter from opposing counsei 1.22. om re anco:o: Qﬂ aoocam:ﬁm . - 0.1
1/23/2008 RR 1.23.08 Letter from oppesing ooc:mmm . o i 0.1
1/23/2008 TCT Sav-quick re update on printing " : S ek S . ‘ . , 0.2
1/23/2008 RR Request for Admission to Umﬁmsama v : I A , 0.2
1/23/2008 RR Cassidy's e-mail re m:méma_ﬁo,_maa_mm__o;m X, e . _ 0.2
1/23/2008 DFT response to Plaintiff's Request for Admission o _, B ; , 0.5
1/23/2008 RR Notice of Depo Cassidy for Saturday (1.26.08) w A . . 0.1
1/23/2008 RR 1.17.08 Letter from o%om_:m ooc:mm_ re oo:*_:smco: Qﬂ no mm:o:o:w for moving meo 0.1
1/23/2008 Lax to Mia travel R T \ 7 , . 6.5
1/24/2008 Recelve E-Mail from mm,c.-Oc_ow re. oou_mw o/ AR AR . ; : . 0.2
1/24/2008 RR Notice of Depo Cassidy for Monday. - " Tt o : 0.2
1/24/2008 TCT opposing counsel re when can we mxnmoﬁ documents - ¢ % 0.2

1/25/2008 Draft Letter to client re response .8 mmncmmﬁ for ﬂqoacoﬁ_o: : ..,..._.,._.. O C o 0.1



RODIER RODIER, P.A. N Umﬂ_r.oﬂ_zmﬁzc costs | David Cassidy adv. Ed Lipton

1/25/2008 Review of Production Qoocam:ﬂm nmm ,,mﬁm,\mzﬂ and xm< mEm__m E,oommw om to DC . 2.4

1/26/2008 Meeting withDCre depoprep - 77 | N v ‘ 1.4
1/28/2008 Deposition of DC A 7 R r 8
1/29/2008 Continuation of Deposition of DC - . . L S i . . 3.75
1/30/2008 Memo and outline depo notes, .Ezrmq. %moo,\.max plan” - - L SR . . 2
1/30/2008 Email to DC re settlement uqouomm_ i Y , 02
1/31/2008 MIA to LAX iravel - b il : ) 8.5
2/1/2008 RR Letter from opposing aoasmm_ re Oo:ﬁmwmm m:a rmhc:@ UmoOmEosm a4, . : 0.1
2/1/2008 Additional. email to DC . . , 0.05
'2/1/2008 Letter from Lavin re Contessa and _.m,_mc:m meOm_:o:m m_,:m__ _.mmuc:mm Umox to _.m<5 si: ccto DC 0.35
2/14/2008 RR zo:om re reading of amuom:_o: AOmmwa_S : (R - . , 0.1
2/14/2008 TCT court reporters re extension to read gs Cassidy is on SS . . , T A 0.2
2/23/2008 Draft 2nd Request for Production ™+ . - - o : 0.3
3/3/2008 RR 2.29.08 Letter from opposing ooc:m& re OORmmmmm anOm_ﬁ_o: . 0.1
3/27/2008 RR 3.27.08 Letter from opposing counsel re PFS . - . , 0.1
3/27/2008 Rec and rev PFS for 200k, ‘Analyze-Proposal for Settlement m:o_ mnmo:oa Swmmmmm rm@m_ mmmmm.,o: into validity _ 0.85
3/27/2008 Email letter to-DC advising of Umouommw for Settlement and o_u_:_o: as to validity . L 0.35
Rec andrev Lipton's «mmno:mm to our mmncmmﬂ for Poacoﬁ_o: :mm mcamo messages of DmSa mBm: 8 moﬁ to ensure :
3/31/2008 we get copies- , Y . & . 0.2
4/1/2008 TCT opposing counsel re Eogcoﬁ_os of <omom3mm_m - .. s o o 0.25
4/2/2008 RR Response to 2nd Request for ﬁ«ogcﬁ_o: . G A/ / . 015
4/2/2008 TCT lLavin re producing phane Emmmmmmw vaom;_o:m ete:l i , 0.25
4/3/2008 RR 4.3.08 Letter from opposing counsel re. a:o:m Bmmmm@mm m chom;_osm of Contessa, _.m,“c:m and Asbury - 0.1
4/3/2008 Draft E-Mail.io BMR re depositions .~ - L , A . 0.15
5/20/2008 RR 5.15.08 Letter from opposing ooc:mwm re Emmamqw méma o _ _ 0.2
5/20/2008 TCT opposing counsel re ommzf:@ which. 30_,wm he is ﬂm_x_:m mcocﬂ ; N 0.2
7/11/2008 RR 7.11.08 Letter from opposing counsel _ co 0.1
8/27/2008 RR 8.27.08 Letter frem opposing counsel’ ,. , /4% ;o 0.1
- .+ 9/10/2008 RR 9.10.08 Letter from opposing counsel - R, O . 0.1
.- .. Bi22/2008 RR Notice of Production from Non Party = NY mﬁmﬁm qjoac@:caa : 0.1
g 8/22/2008 RR Subpoena Duces Tecum to NY State: .q..:oﬂocm:g.ma w attached: Q%_w_.ﬁ A / - 025
8/22/2008 DFT Cbjection to Notice of Production from 20: vm% m mcwvoosm \ : . . 7 , 0.2
9/29/2008 RR 9.29.08 Letter from opposing counsel . ‘ AT 5 T , ? X 0.1
10/1/2008 Letter from Lavin re depos and c:;m.ﬁmﬁm_ mmﬁ : oA ' : . : . 0.2
10/1/2008 TC with Lavin. R ’ Y NN T s 0.3 .

10/3/2008 TC with DC re Contessa s Ty Yy G v . 0.2




RODIER RODIER, _.u.?z ‘. © . DETAL OF jzﬁ»zc COSTS e * David Cassidy adv. Ed Lipton

10/3/2008 TC E_E Lavin toreport on DC m<m__m§__€ re Oosammm Qm_uom m:a m:< Qsm_,m . i 0.2

- 12/10/2008 RR 12.10.08 Lestter from opposing counsel = R - _ _ 0.1
"~ 12/10/2008 RR Notice of Taking Deposition Contessa § M o 0.1
. A2/10/2008 Receive and Analyze Subpoena Duces Tecum Contessa - - G , : 0.3
S0 12/23/2008 RR Letter from opposing counsel dated 12/23/08 y G : "2 . : 0.1
. -12/24/2008 RR Letter from opposing counsel dated12/24/08 e W 0.1
. 1/13/2009 RR 1.13.09 Letier from opposing counsel. - - T A % _ 0.1
1/14/2008 RR Re-Notice of Taking Deposition & Subpoena Oo:ﬁmmmm R oA ‘ , 0.25

. 1/15/2009 TC with David re speaking with Contessa for Prep =~ R 3 £y 0.2

" 1/15/2008 TC with Contessa re case and Florida'réschedule ~ iy , - 0.3
1/30/2009 Draft Request for Copies Peterson & Smith. mnc_:m IOmv_Mm_ v, L - A 0.25
3/2/200¢ Partial Travel for Depo {plus mmmo oo oomﬂ Um_oév P ..v . ) . . 8

3/3/2009 Preparation for Contessa Depo, _.m< oﬂ _.683 amno mna mmzmm_, m:m:mm o_,omm m:a o_:_Sm oﬁ no_sﬁw rev exhibits/femails 3

3/4/2009 Deposition of Contessa plus a,mzm_ 85.03 om_om A S/, . . , G

' 3/5/2009 TCwith David to advise outcome of Depo, case. a_mocmmwo: V. , 0.4

- 3/11/2008 Rec and :mé letter from Lavin with.depos mxj_cn oo_u_mm : S Vs 0.2

" 8/4/2009 RR 6.4,09 Letter from opposingcounsel © © . . T : 0.1
6/4/2009 RR Notice of Taking Deposition DT & SDT >mcc€ AR Y : N 0.25
6/4/2009 RR Notice of Taking Deposition DT & SDT Keenland R, . ‘ 0.25

6/4/2009 RR Notice of Taking Deposition DT & w_u,ﬁ Daly. ‘ o SRR : 0.25

9/1/2009 RR 9.1.09 _.mﬂmw from opposing counsel - VT S : 0.1

9/1/2009 RR Notice of Taking Deposition DT m SDT _Amm:_ma s ¥ _ , 0.25

9/4/2009 rec and rev several trial subpoenas’ © BT /) . : 0.4

- 9/30/2009 muqmvmﬁm:o: for deposition in KY - . : L . . 1.25

..~ - . 10/2/2009 Deposition of Wilkinson of Keenland - * . .. : D, Y, ) 2.25
. 10/2/2009 Deposition of Carson Asbury O e . 2.25
= - 10/3/2009 Letter to client detailing depo - Deposition mc33mzmm o 15
- 10/6/2009 RR 10.6.09 Letter from opposing counsel with amgm&o: mxv_gm e, 0.3
S 11/30/2009 RR ZQ”_om of Filing Affidavit of Lipton. " LG K’ _ : 0.1
0 11/30/2009 Receive and Analyze Affidavit of EEos o y W N . . ¢ . . 0.3
. 11/30/2008 Rec and rev plaintiff's MSJ, mxm%Bmam m:a mm_amém ,,osmé _mi m:a mﬁmﬁcﬁm cited - 3
11/30/2008- email fo DC™ S Ae S C 01
12/1/2009 Receive and Analyze Plaintiff zm,_ . o, m, .. ._ e N . ) 0.75
+12/2/2009 RR 12.2.09 Letter from opposing oocswm_ W Ay % S Y _ 0.1

12/3/2008 Tom Daly deposition 8 N . : - 1.75




" 12/10/2009 RR Notice of Hearing 2.24.10 - Plaintif MSJ

. 2/12/2010 TC with Silver re Affidavit

" 2/23(2010 Draft Memo in Opposition to omﬁmama MSy Amz_mv

RODIER RODIER, P.A. : | omﬁ.r_Omﬂ.gnm..b,zn,,ooqu.m

12/3/2008 Preparation Ndn Tom Daly _umuo ﬂmﬁmé file: m:a notes, Emﬁ ncmmﬁ_o:m
12/3/2009 Tom Daly Deposition Attendance L

12/3/2009 Post Deposition note review and UmuOm:_o: summary _mzm« 6 Umﬁn
12/4/2009. RR 12.4.09 Letter from OC with deposition exhibits

2/2/2010 Email to DC

21412010 TC with DC re case and status in _,mwvo:mm to.email re zm,_
2/8/2010 TC with DC re Contessa and affidavits .
- 21812010 TC-with Contessa re Lipton, m_.mmamﬁm mémam Half Imm,.as m:a mmams.ﬁ for MSJ
2/8/2010 Email to'DC fe pregnant horse mmmmw to. _.683
N 2/8/2010 Email response from DC :
L. .2/11/2010 Re-~review.of MSJ, LR law and v_mma_:@m ._.O én: Zmnmzm _uau ﬁoﬁ _sm.h amﬁm:mw

2/12/2010 Draft mjﬂamé for Silver's signature.

211212010 Drafi of Contessa Affidavit .

2/12/2010 Draft of Cassidy affidavit

2/12/2010 TC with Cassidy re Affidavit

2{15/2010 Draft Letter to Judge re rescheduling. Zm;
2{15/2010 Draft Motion to Continue M8J -~ -+ -7

2115/2010 Draft Order on Motion to Continue MSJ: .

2/15/2010 Amendments to Cassidy Affidavit, email 6 mcm
2/16/2010 Email from Silver, wants fo add _m:@cmmm to mm_amé
2/16/2010 Email to Silver

2/17/2010 Fax-to Coniessa

2/17/2010 TC with Boyd re Contessa. mm_amsﬂ

2/17/2010 Email from Contessa re orm:mmm to. Ew mmamsﬁ 3 mam__mv m%m:aama 8 mmamsﬂ me__ for m_o_u_.o<m_
2/18/2010 Draft fax to opposing counsel* . ; - L

2/18/2010 Draft Notice of Filing Affidavit, o% Ommm_%
2/18/2010 Draft Zo:om of Filing >jn_mm<; of Oo:ﬁmmmm .

2/22{2010 Draft 20:8 of Filing. Umvom_:o: Qﬂ EEO: .

2/22/2010 RS on Plaintiff's MSJ & RS to canm«m gﬂo_ﬁ 3mm::@
2/22/2010 Letter to Lavin

2/23{2010 Draft Letter to Judge re Defendant Memg i in O%om_m_o: to zm,_

21232010 Prepare for Hearing on Plaintiff's: gmg

David Cassidy adv. Ed Lipton

2

3
1.5
0.3
0.1
0.4
0.4
0.2
0.35
0.1
0.1
3.2
0.5
0.4
0.5
0.85
0.2
0.3
0.3
02
0.2
0.2
0.1
0.1
0.15
0.45
0.1
0.1
0.1
01
0.1
3.25
0.2
0.3
2.5
2.5
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2/23/2010 Preparation of ouuomaos memo 8 zmg m:a Qm_zmé o Ea@m g _ 35
- 21242010 Attend Hearing on Plaintiff MSJ~ ~ ~ + 1 . SRR , 1.75
3/4/2010 RR Order Denying PlaintiffMsd =~ - -~ -~~~ AL AT ) L ; : . 0.35
3/17/2010 RR Letter from.opposing counsel to Judge re Motion for mmoo:m_amwmro: . D / 0.1
3/17/2010 Receive and Analyze Plaintiff Motion for: Reconisideration v : % o . 1.25
7. 3/18/2010 Draft Letter to Judge re Opposition to. Plaintiff Motion for, mmoo:wam«muo: 7 : e : 0.3
- . 3/18/2010 Draft Opposition to Plaintiff Motion for Reconsideration .. 0 : v - - 275
-~ -3/18/2010 Draft Order Denying Plaintiff Motion for Reconsideration . .~ . . - . : 0.2
4/20/2010 TCT JA re no ruling on Motion for _mmoc:m_am_.m:om AN Y / 0.3
4/20/2010 Resubmit Opposition to mmoo:mamﬂmﬁ_o: T o 0.3
6/1/10 Receive and Analyze Order setting trial - - S : 0.5
8/12/10 Prep planning re expert witnesses & Bmvo:aim to expert _:ﬁmzommﬁo:mm /2 0.3
8/12/10 Objection to Expert _:ﬁm:ommﬁo:mm #1-7 not yet finalized - < I - . 0.15
8/18/10 TC with opposing counsel re extending trial deadlines N K% 0.2
- 8/19/10 Receive E-Mail from opposing counsel re trial deadlines A 7 A : 2y 0.1
8/20{10 RR Letter from opposing counssl re trial deadlines D S " _ S , 0.1
8/20/10 Draft E-Mail 1o opposing counssl re Uauomma extensions. . . . 0.15
8/23/10 FU TC with opposing counsel re extending trial deadlines - - : . o 0.2
8/24/10 TCF.opposing counsel re extension of trial deadlines. =~ -~~~ _ : . 0.1
8/24/10 Draft Letter to opposing counsel re mmﬂmmw:m:ﬁ to extend trial amma::mm , Ry A 0.2
8/25/10 Letter.from opposing counsel re m@_.mmam:_ {0 extend trial amma__:mm , v K .Y - 0.1
8/25/10 Receive E-Mail-and letter from OUUOm_jm ooc:mm_ re mm_ooﬁ_oz oﬂ Bma_mﬁo_, ano:a 8, ) 0.2
9/1/10 Receive E-Mail from opposing counsel. - ) 0t
8/1/10 RR Notice of Production from Non- _um% and mcunomsm _ucomm ._lmocs 8 mmm_@-._._vﬁo: : . . 0.25
9/9/10 Draft Objection to Plaintiff's Notice of Production from Non- _um_é {o _umm,m-.:n.hos , E 0.2
9/23/10 RR Letter from opposing counsel re. mm_oo:o: of wOﬂx as their mx_uon A 0.05
9/23/10 RR Letter from. opposing counsel re mo_,x_w 09353 AL 2 0.1
9/28/10 Draft Motion to Compel - PR Y _ 0.3
9/28/10 Receive Letter from opposing ooc:mm_ re. amnom_:o: of 55 mm_:voé (3 h - - 01
9/28/10 RR Notice of Taking Deposition Duces. Tecum Lyn xmscoé _ G : _ 0.1
9/30/10 RR Amended Notice of Taking DmUOm&os Lynn Rainbow = .70 T - 041
9/30/10 Prepara for Mediation; TC é_% and Qm Bmmr:@ E_E o__osﬂ PR ;. - 2
10/1/10 Attend Mediation L RPN 4
10/1/10 Draft Notes to file re mediator's opinion - ‘@, AL S Y 0.5
* 10/1/10 Draft Motion to Continue Jury Trial and 20:8 of Iwm::m R L 0.5

- 10/4/10 RR rmﬁmq from opposing counssl in response 8 Motion 8 Oonﬁ_:cm . , . : 0.1




. RODIER RODIER, PA. . DETALOFTIMEANDCOSTS David Cassidy adv. Ed Lipton

10/11/10 Attend hearing on Motion to continue trial - L Y _ 0.75

10/18/10 E-mail from opposing counsel re resetting trial ) O L : 0.05
10/21/10 RR Letter from opposing counsel with aoocamim mzmosma m.oB wmm_@ ._._Eo: ; . 0.65
10/26{10 Receive and Analyze Proposal for Settlement - -« BV N Y : 0.25
10/27/10 Draft Letter to client enclosing Muawommm for wm%wam_\; v T : E 0.2
10/27/10 Draft E-Mail to client § SN . 0.05
10/28/10 TC with DC re OJ letter, doesn’t sm<m ﬂsw ommj to do pay, soﬁm Hn__m S , 0.25
10/29/10 Prepare for Deposition of Lynn mm_:cos_ w «ms@a Qn aoocamam nagcoma by wilness in ma<m:om : _ 1.15
10/28/10 Deposition of ES: Rainbow ’ : : / 1
11/4/10 BMR RS and analysis of Proposal for: mmn_mBmﬁ Oh A, . . 0.4 .
11/15/10 Receive and Analyze new trial order: =7 oL K R , * , . 0.5
11/16/10 RR Letter from opposing ooczmm_ re new. :_m_ order - LA B . ‘ 0.1
11/24/10 RR Letter from opposing counsel -~ "1 My T, Y% o 0.1
11/28/10 E-Mails with opposing counsel re date *oﬂ q_mo_omc_.m of mxumzm f Y T . 0.2
11/30/10 Receive E-Mail from opposing ooc:mm_ re Qmﬁmm for mxvmzm S _ o - : ‘ . 0.08
11/30/10 TC’s with Lavin {8) : o, . : 1.2
12/2/10 Receive and Analyze 3rd Wmncmmﬁ ﬂg. P.oacoﬁ_o: .. y- 2, - . : 0.4
12/2/10 Receive and Analyze 2nd Interrogatories. - D, . ., 0.3
12/2/10 RR Letter-from opposing counsel re amnom&osm of. <<_3@. mumﬁmao: m ws.__ﬁs mmsamqoi /7S 0.15
12/2/10 Receive E-Mail from opposing counsel o . © 041
12/3/10 Receive E-Mail from opposing counsel. sﬁ: zozoo of ._.mx_sm Umwom_:o: and mccmom:m ﬂQ. Eric Wing . v 0.1
12/3/10 Receive E-Mail from opposing counsel with Notice of Taking. Omﬁom;_o: and Subpoenafor Craig Banderoff % . 0.1
12/3/10 Draft E-Mail to opposing counsel re court oamaa mediation cannot attend 12/21 depos - : , v 045
12/3/10 RR Re-Notice of Taking Deposition. Eric Wing {location osm:mm ozg , K : A 0.05
12/3/10 RR Notice of Taking Deposition vmﬂmao: & Smith 7 SNy % 0.1
12/3/10 Draft E-Mall to opposing counsel re unilaterally set depositions: =~ - . . A -0
12/6/10 RR Letter from opposing counsel re dates for amvo,ﬂw;_osm o v 0.1
12/6/10 RR Notice of Taking Deposition zma: Z:mm__m AN _ -~ 01
12/6/10 RR 2nd Set of Expert Interrogatories = T, i , . 0.2
12/7110 RR Letter from opposing counsel re. Qmuomm_osm for mxum_,ﬁm RS S 0.1
12/8/10 Draft Motion for Protective Order, Notice Qn Imm:nm and rmzmﬂ 8 Egmm . . 1
12/8/10 Draft Notice of Trial Conflict - - N . : / - Yy 0.1
12/9/10 RR Order on Motion for Reconsideration.on- zm,_ . SRR 7N B , 0.2
12/9/10 RR Letter from opposing counsel re expert witness a_mo_OmEo _ . : - 0.1
Am:o:o Receive and Analyze Expert E_Smmm Uao_owca L ¥R s T : . 0.3

12/10/10 Draft Expert Witness Disclosure ~ . = "~ - N/ L ‘ : 0.5
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12/13/10 RR Letter from opposing ooc:wg re Eor.o: *oq QoﬁmoSm oamﬁ Y o : . 0.2
12/14/10 Hearing on Motion for Protective Order™ - oo , 0.75

- 1211410 E-mail chain with Danny Lavin re Qouow&oz amﬂmm per court o&mw 59 e 0.25
.7 12115110 RR Letter from opposing counsel re mo:ma:__:@ ofexperts. .- o - 0.1
7" 12/15/10 Recsive and Analyze Motion to Strike Plaintiff's Experts = . ..” (¥, . . : 0.35

12/17/10 RR Notice of Hearing - Motion to mﬁ:xo Plaintiff's Experts . ‘ y . , . 0.1
12/20/10 RR Letter from opposing counsel re possibility of settisment. ot : _ 0.1
12/21/10 RR Letier from opposing counsel re order on MPO and. amnomso:m i oo B A . . o 15
12/22/10 RR Notice of Taking Deposition Kenny. rm.hc:m : BRI C /S, . . : 01
12122110 RR Notice of Taking Deposition Craig Banderoff- ~ ~ = . .0 %/ - 01
12/22/10 RR Notice of Taking Deposition Steven Silver =~ - iy W : 0.1
12/22/10 RR Notice of Taking Deposition Jeffrey Burke. -~ . .= 7 . : , 0.1
12/22/10 RR Notice of Taking Deposition-rv-Weiner" .- SNEh N Y . 0.1
12/22/10 RR Notice of Taking Deposition Eric Wing-- -~~~ » .0 . : a1
12/22/10 RR Notice of Taking Deposition Peterson & Smith R 7 YR : 01
12/22/10 RR Notice of Taking Deposition NY State Thoroughbred m_,mmasm m Um,..m*ovam:ﬁ o 041
12/23/10 RR Letter from opposing counsel re Silver: Weiner and Burke Qmuow:o:m YL 0.1
12/23/10 RR Letter from opposing counsel re follow up. with Lipton. ammaam settlement ) v - 041
12/23/10 RR Letter from opposing counse| re purpose of Eric Wing deposition - Y . 0.1
12/23/10 Receive, Analyze and Research Motion to Amend Complaint to >aa Punitive Umsmmmm claim - / 2.5
12/23/10 RR Notjce of Hearing - Motion to Amend for Punitive Damages "~ . . 01
12/23/10 Receive E-Mail from opposing oo::mm_ re. moam_zm:om 9d mm::om *9. mxcm:m " .. o 0.1
12/27/10 Draft Notice of Unavallability " : v 0.1
12/28/10 RR Letter from opposing counsel re mmEmBm:ﬁ & valuation 9_" n_msz%m o_m_Bm . ¢ , 0.25
12/28/10 RR Letter from opposing counsel re. mxr_c:m fo _a__uﬁo: amvo ition.- ) . 0.1
12/28/10 BMR Draft E-Mail to opposing oo::mm_ R - . 0.2
12/28/10 TC from Danny Lavin . L Y. : _ 0.2
12/28/10 RR Letter from opposing counsel re Em Sm_ m%gmao: . 0.1
12/29/10 RR Letter from opposing counsel re various matters DNy s ; 0.2
12/28/10 RR Letter from opposing counsel re they. want to keep trial Qmﬂo S - _ 0.1
12/30/10 Draft Emergency Motion for Protective Order, Motion to Continue ._.:mu Order and Letter to judge 0.75
12/30/10 RR Letter from opposing counsel and mzm_ﬁo m&morma Em ﬁmm ,m:ucﬁmd_o: . 0.85
12/30/10 RR Plaintiff's 4th Request for mu_,oacozo: R BRI 5" : o 0.25
12/30/10 RR Plaintiff's 3rd Interrogatories .~ = /T . 0.25
12/30/10 Draft E-Mail to DC re Expert Dao_omca o R T . 0.4

12/30/10 Draft E-Mail to BMRre Ledune - -~ ©. - = © N o ; 0.3
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12/31/10 TC with DC re experts; FU Memo to File.
12/31/10 December AL Teleconferences (7).

1/3/11

113114
1/3/11
1/3/11
113111
11311
113111
113111
11411
174111
174114
114111
174111
14111
1/4/11
114141
1/4/11
115111
14511
15111
115111
115114
1/5/11
115114
115114
1/6/11
1/6/11
1/6/11
1/6/11
1/6/11
1/6/11
116111
1/6/11

Attend hearing on Motion to Strike mxumn /Z_ﬁ:mmmmm

Draft mgm«@m:Q Motion for *u_,oﬂmofm Oamﬁ or S the Eﬁmq:mz m _soﬂ_o: to Oo:m:cm Sm_ zQ_om of Hearing msa letter

to judge. -

Draft E-Mail to opposing counsel- 2_5 mmmo:ma Qoﬁmoﬁzm o_dQ. m:a ma%mmmwm Ucﬁwcm:ﬁ ﬂo court order
Draft Answers to Second _:ﬁmqommﬂo:mm

Attempted TC to DC; RS address and n:osm for wﬂm,a: m%mﬂ om___ﬂo mﬁm,a: Silver

Draft E-Mail to Steven Silver with. mmamsﬁ attached - RUR”

Draft E-Mail to opposing counsel re Steven Silver '

Draft E-Mail to DC re appearance in court on Motion to m:_wm mxnmnm

Draft Response to 3rd Request for Production
RR Re-Ngtice of Taking Deposition’ m*m«,m: Silver.
RR Re-Notice of Taking Deposition Peterson & Smith mncSm Iowu;m_
RR Letter from opposing counsel re. mmEmBoa 85k offer T
RR Letter from opposing counssl :w Emno:mm to N:a Sﬁmqommﬁo:mm
Receive E-Mail from Steven m,zmﬂ -
Receive E-Mail from Lipton to SC -
Recelve E-Mail from opposing. oo%mmm re m<m__m§:€ for amnom;_o:m
Draft E-Mail to DC re assistance with Interrogatories -
RR mc%_mamam_ Expert Withess U_moEwEm

RR Letter from opposing counsel re mxnoa depositions, :3_3@ o,ﬂ
Draft Motion to Disqualify Counsel for the Plaintiff /
Draft Response to 2nd Expert _:.ﬁm:omm”ozmw ‘

Mulfiple T.Cs with opposing counsel.re. mznc_mﬁ_o: orm:@mw
BMR Tom Daly deposition summary :

Attempted TCs to DC & Draft E-Mail 8 DO 8 E_Smmmmm dqoﬂ Sm
Draft Witness. & Exhibit list fy:

Draft Notice of Taking Deposition. moon Im<

Draft Notice of Taking Deposition >_m5 _wo%

Um_uoméos of Steven Silver

Deposition of Craig Banderoff

Attend Calendar call -

Draft Emergency Motion to Stay _uﬂoomma_smm and 00335 .:,_mu
RS case law re evidentiary hearing not required for hearing . ¢
TC with Jeffrey Burke; e-mail documents in m%m:om. of deposi moq :

..m_nw_,,,a judge and natice of hearing

David Cassidy adv. Ed _.883

.05
1
1

2.18
0.25
02
£0.75
0.1
0.05
0.2
0.35
0.1
0.1
0.25
0.1
0.1
0.2
0.1
0.05
0.2
0.2
15
0.3
0.5
1.5
0.3

0.2
0.2

1.25
1.15
0.35

0.6
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1/6/11 BMR trial preparation; case review; .ﬁom é;: ovuomm:@ oo::mmﬁ . . : . 2 ‘9

1/8/11 TC with Irv.Weiner %S O, T : 035
1/8/11 RR Exhibits for Banderoff omuomaoz ¢ e ‘ 035
17111 RR aoocamam e-mailed in advance of Eric E_:@ Q%om_co: ”. L S - 0.5
117111 TC with Jeff Burke; Draft chBmQ 8 m_sx . R / : , v 0.8
1/7/11 Deposition of Eric Wing N Yy : Do N ‘ 1
1/7/11 Deposition of Kenny LeJune o . N g s ‘ , : . 1
1/7{11 Deposition of Jeffrey Burke : _ TS ST o 2
1/7/11 Draft Notice of Cancellation of 1/10/11. Imm::m onMPO AT . TV 0.1
1/7/11 RR Letter from Defendant confirming MPO :mm:mm is omaom_uma C . , : - 01
1/7/11 RR Motion to Require Discovery Responses - Mo T . N4 , 0.2
1/7/11 RR Notice of Hearing for 1/18 - -~ ,, e . 0.1
177111 RR §0m03 to Compel Better Psmém_.m fo-2nd _Rm:.omm"o:mw o . A 0.2
17111 RR _.mxmq from.opposing counsel re Irv Weiner not available; Q_moo,\mé 0594 : / 0.1
1/7/11 BMR trial preparation; case review; TCs sﬁj o_u_oom_:@ oo::mm_ X o 8
1/8/11 Letter to DG re current offer and trial risks - R S . . 1.75
-1/10/11 Draft Motion for Summary Lcamamz re O«m_ >u$mama 28&; Z:@ / _ 0.75
1/10/11 Draft Motion for Summary Judgment re Unfair & Deceptive Trade Muw.mo:omm . : : 0.75
1/10/11 Draft zo:o: for Summary Judgment re. Breach of Oral Agreement .~ . o v 0.75
1/10/11 Draft Notice of Reliance on _uﬂm,:ocmq m,_ma Umnom;_o:m in OUUOm;_oz 8 MSJ - . . : 0.1
1/10/11 Trial preparation T 3.5
1/111/11 Multiple TCs with opposing counsel mmn_m:,_ma of ommm ooBBmzo_:@ :.03 beginning of ._m: . 1.75
1/11/11 Release from oppesing counsel; revisions™ - - /T 05
1/11/11 Draft Notice of Cancellation of Hearing - o o ey : ; ; . 0.1
1/11/11 Draft Notice of Cancellation of Depositions (Bork and. me S : 0.2
1/13/11 RR Letter from opposing counsel ‘confirming. seftlement Bmorma m:a attaching documents . 6.25
1/18/11 RR Letter from opposing coungel re settlement, wire SﬂEozosm m,a . Y ‘ 01
1/18/11 RR Letter from opposing counsel re dismissal and release , , 0.1
1/19/11 RR Letter from opposing counsel re proposed releases . 0 - .__ _u. _ 0.1
1/21/11 Draft E-Mail and Receive E-Mail from'DC re release :w_.smv .0 i 0.2
1/24/11 RR Letter from opposing counsel with proposed lease for DC mnmorma A . 0.3
" RRLetter from opposing counsel én: @mzm_,m_ release mxmocﬂma g ma _.683 and mxmo:ﬁma dismissal with prejudice .

21411 attached : : 0.2
2/23/11 RR Letter from opposing oocnmm_ re _,mn_momama ormox 0.1

2128111 Recsive m Mail from opposing oo::mm_ m:a amnoza re 83 gn mxmocaa release _ < _ 0.1
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B37/11 filing.

DETAIL OF TIME AND, COSTS

- David Cassidy adv. Ed Lipton

Receive E-Mail from opposing counsel mmm..o_..m: E-Mail to. ovvommu@..ﬂogm& re <o_c:§.,<..0wm3mm.mm_ sent to Court for

TOTAL HOURS
.. HOURLY RATE - $400.00

0.15

314.9

TOTAL FEES $125,960.00

. ) COSTS
Courier to Courthouse 12/30/10

Mediation Services 10/1/10

- Esquire 2/24/10 Hearing
' . Sav-Quick Printing #25041
4 CA Couriers, Inc.

. Sav-Quick Printing #24014

Esquire Deposition Services .

Esquire Deposition Services
Esquire Deposition Services

~ Compass Investigations
Discovery copies - Stacy Moran

UPS:

LAX to MIA 10/3
Transfer o LAX

~ Car Rental
Transfer from LAX
FLL to LAX 10/8
Transfer to LAX
LAX to MIA1/23/08

MIA to LAX 1/31 -

Auto
Transfer from LAX

; March 2009 Contessa Depo Travel
_ . Copies for Production -

Courier

Total Costs -

- $26.00
$555.50
$990.00
$270.30
$25.00
. $6218
$617.50
$711.30

 $1,505.50

$155.00
$44.90
$16.26
$506.20
$42.00
$429.80
$55.00
$388.00
$42.00
$519.00
$444 .00
$267.06
$55.00
$1,180.00

o
¢
o

28

$8,261.50



RODIER RODIER, P.A, _ . DETALOFTMEANDCOSTS " David Cassidy adv. Ed Lipton

. TOTAL FEES AND COSTS $134,221.50
"~ LESS 3/10/08 Payment $10,000.00 -
Less 3/26/10 Payment $15,000.00

- TOTAL OUTSTANDING $109,221.50



